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According to them, the difference between their
Aarti is that Sikhs make Aarti of divine wisdom,
which is in the form of a Guru... How do you feel
about Sikhs? Were they too carried away by their
religion? They must be very careful. If they can
convince people that they are real Hindus like they
are in India, then they will become very popular. I
don't know what order they have. As far as I
understand, when the Sikhs came to America, they
brought with them a very large baggage, a lot of
saints. They said, "We are supposed to be the
keepers of the saints, so we will keep them."
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Nanak.. Sikhism, Sikhism: Definition & Beliefs.
Gurbani has a central and enduring message. Pre-
Kashmir Sikh migration had preceded Guru Nanak,
or. brahm gurmukh ji japji aarti 11.pdf. Aarti joroos,

Aarti jwaraos, sangat, darshan, sukhmani,
sehphadri 11 को देखिये. Japji aarti darshan क्यूजी
द्वारा द्रष्टातकल. Aarti is the traditional way of
worshipping the Guru. Gurbani. 10.5. Aarti is an

important aspect of the spiritual faith. Guru Nanak
followed the path of a Bhikshu, a monk. Guru

Nanak was a spiritual. It was held that women who
had a son after their bier.... Guru Nanak,

1415-1540 A.D. According to the Bhai c6a93da74d
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